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The contemporary reader of English poetry is able to take pleasure in the sounds and movements of the
English language in works written over the past eight centuries, and to find poems that convey powerful
emotions and vivid images from this entire period. This book investigates the ways in which poets have
exploited the resources of the language as a spoken medium--its characteristic rhythms, its phonetic qualities,
its deployment of syntax--to write verse that continues to move and delight. The chapters in the first of the
two parts examine a number of issues relating to poetic form: the resurgence of interest in formal questions
in recent years, the role of syntactic phrasing in the operation of poetry, the function of rhyme, and the
relation between sound and sense. The second part is concerned with rhythm and metre, explaining and
demonstrating 'beat prosody' as a tool of poetic analysis, and discussing three major traditions in English
versification: the free four-beat form used in much popular verse, the controlled power of the iambic
pentameter, and the twentieth-century invention of free verse. All these topics are discussed by means of
particular case studies, from the metrical form of a thirteenth-century lyric to uses of sound in recent poetry.
Among the many poets whose work is considered are Spenser, Milton, Dryden, Keats, Tennyson, Hardy,
Yeats, Frost, Ashbery, Hill, Plath, Paterson, and Prynne. Drawing on Derek Attridge's thirty-five years of
engagement with the forms of poetry, this volume provides extensive evidence of the importance of close
attention to the moving and sounding of language in the poems we enjoy.
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From reader reviews:

Melissa Hopkins:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
move, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or read a book eligible Moving Words: Forms of
English Poetry? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time with the
favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have different opinion?

David Marx:

Now a day those who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each information they get. How
individuals to be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book.
Reading a book can help people out of this uncertainty Information especially this Moving Words: Forms of
English Poetry book since this book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the information in this
book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Carlos Terrill:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the headline Moving Words:
Forms of English Poetry suitable to you? Often the book was written by well-known writer in this era. The
particular book untitled Moving Words: Forms of English Poetryis one of several books which everyone read
now. This book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new
age that you ever know prior to. The author explained their thought in the simple way, therefore all of people
can easily to recognise the core of this e-book. This book will give you a lot of information about this world
now. To help you see the represented of the world with this book.

Elaine Roberts:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray a person, why because this Moving Words: Forms of English Poetry
publication written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book which might be understand by
anyone who else read the book. Written within good manner for you, leaking every ideas and composing
skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still question Moving Words: Forms of English
Poetry as good book not simply by the cover but also through the content. This is one publication that can
break don't ascertain book by its include, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick this specific!?
Oh come on your studying sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.
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