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This book provides students of nursing profession with solid foundation for taking care of patients in the
community. The author made all possible efforts towards this in simple and effective language. He has
provided extensive treatment of the subject in a very lucid and cogent manner, so that students can grasp the
subject very clearly and completely. It covers all the areas specified by the Nursing Councils, Universities
and Boards of Nursing that are imparting Diplomas and Degrees in Nursing. BT Basavanthappa, recently
retired from Government service as Professor and Principal of the Government College of Nursing,
Bengaluru. He has vast experience in Bedside Nursing, i.e., he worked as a staff nurse for 16 years at District
McGann Hospital, Shimoga. He did BSc Nursing (Post-Certificate) from the same college (1978), and
obtained Masters degree in Nursing from Rajkumar Amrit Kaur College of Nursing, New Delhi (1988). In
1994, Bangalore University conferred on him Doctoral Degree in Nursing. With this he is the FIRST
PERSON in the state of KARNATAKA, who earned and awarded PhD in Nursing. Now, he is Consultant
and Professor of reputed college of Nursing, Bengaluru, Karnataka. With over 35 years of service as a
bedside nurse and as an academician, Dr BT Basavanthappa has taught all the areas of Nursing in UG and
PG Courses of Nursing. He is a recognised PhD guide by the Indian Nursing Council and Indian
Universities. He has served at Universities in various capacities and his professional development and
contributions are well documented at the local, national and global levels. He also held various positions in
Associations like GNAK, TNAI, etc. and also Karnataka State Government Employees Association. At
present, he is the President of RGUHS Nursing Teachers Association, Karnataka. He takes it as a matter of
pride to shoulder any responsibility in the interest of Nursing Profession. He has been a recipient of many
prestigious awards for his excellence. 1. Introduction to Nursing Profession 2. Trends in Health Care System
3. Leadership in Nursing 4. Nurse as a Manager5. Concepts of Administration 6. Planning 7. Organizing 8.
Staffing 9. Directing 10. Coordinating 11. Reporting and Recording12. Budgeting13. Human Resource
Management 14. Job Evaluation 15. Administration of Health Services in India 16. Organization of Health
Services in India 17. Planning in Health Programs in India 18. Management in Health Care Delivery
System19. Hospital Administration 20. Nursing Service Administration 21. Discipline in Nursing 22. Health
Care Economics and Nursing 23. Educational Administration in Nursing 24. Clinical Supervision 25.Quality
Control 26. Staff Development 27. Administration of Wage and Salary 28. Role of Employees Union in
Administration 29. Concepts of Employees Welfare and Social Security 30. Legal and Ethical Aspects of
Nursing 31. Current Issues in Nursing.
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From reader reviews:

Helen Johnson:

Now a day people who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by interact with the internet and
the resources included can be true or not require people to be aware of each facts they get. How individuals
to be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information especially this Nursing Administration book as this
book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred percent
guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Linda Sandoval:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the title Nursing
Administration suitable to you? The particular book was written by famous writer in this era. The particular
book untitled Nursing Administrationis the one of several books that everyone read now. That book was
inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this book you will enter the new dimension that
you ever know prior to. The author explained their strategy in the simple way, and so all of people can easily
to know the core of this publication. This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. So
you can see the represented of the world in this book.

Amanda Doss:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them family or
their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, as well as playing
video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read the book. It
is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent the whole day to
reading a e-book. The book Nursing Administration it is very good to read. There are a lot of folks that
recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have enough
space to create this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book from a smart
phone. The price is not very costly but this book offers high quality.

Mary Wines:

This Nursing Administration is great publication for you because the content that is certainly full of
information for you who always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. This book reveal it
information accurately using great arrange word or we can claim no rambling sentences within it. So if you
are read this hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight forward
sentences but tough core information with beautiful delivering sentences. Having Nursing Administration in
your hand like finding the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that no reserve that
offer you world inside ten or fifteen minute right but this book already do that. So , this is good reading
book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt in which?
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