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"Superb. Combining unassailable analysis with a thorough grasp of economic and political trends, Duncan
Green convincingly argues that the region is headed for even greater tragedy unless people move toward
more equitable and ecologically sustainable models of economic development."
—Walden Bello, founder of Focus on the Global South

The first edition of Green's Silent Revolution, published in 1995, described the imposition of neoliberal
economic models in Latin America, the role of the IMF and World Bank in enforcing them, and their
consequences. In this second, revised edition, Green extends his analysis into the present, showing how the
current economic meltdown in Latin America was prepared by an economic strategy that could never live up
to its own claims.

The new edition was completed in a moment when the Argentinean economy is in ruins, Brazil is on the
brink of collapse, riots are taking place in Uruguay, Peru, and in Paraguay, and a U.S. supported coup has
just been averted in Venezuela. It will be an essential work for understanding ongoing developments in the
region.
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From reader reviews:

William Coker:

Inside other case, little people like to read book Silent Revolution: The Rise and Crisis of Market Economics
in Latin America. You can choose the best book if you like reading a book. Providing we know about how is
important a new book Silent Revolution: The Rise and Crisis of Market Economics in Latin America. You
can add information and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, because from book
you can learn everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you will be known. About
simple point until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we could open a book or maybe searching
by internet unit. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's study.

Richard Delarosa:

This Silent Revolution: The Rise and Crisis of Market Economics in Latin America are reliable for you who
want to be a successful person, why. The reason of this Silent Revolution: The Rise and Crisis of Market
Economics in Latin America can be one of many great books you must have is giving you more than just
simple reading through food but feed a person with information that possibly will shock your previous
knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions both in e-
book and printed kinds. Beside that this Silent Revolution: The Rise and Crisis of Market Economics in
Latin America giving you an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical
thinking that we realize it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Andres Edelman:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this Silent Revolution: The Rise and Crisis of
Market Economics in Latin America guide written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to
make book that could be understand by anyone who read the book. Written within good manner for you,
dripping every ideas and producing skill only for eliminate your hunger then you still hesitation Silent
Revolution: The Rise and Crisis of Market Economics in Latin America as good book not just by the cover
but also by content. This is one book that can break don't assess book by its cover, so do you still needing a
different sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already alerted you so why you
have to listening to another sixth sense.

Eugene Howard:

You could spend your free time to read this book this guide. This Silent Revolution: The Rise and Crisis of
Market Economics in Latin America is simple to create you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach,
train and soon. If you did not have got much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy typically
the e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot
of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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